Attachment E: Appellant's Request to Withdraw Their Appeal

Road Fee Appeal for Permit PMT2014-00702 on Dawn Road [
“ Frank Honeycutt to: S Lariz 12/03/2014 06:18 PM

Thank you Mrs. Lariz. | will begin processing your request to withdraw the appeal. In the mean time, | am
also directing to have this item cleared or released on your permit application. However, please allow a
day for that to happen.

If you have any other questions on this or run into any problems then please let me know.

Frank Honeycutt, P.E.

Development Services Division Manager

Department of Public Works

County of San Luis Obispo

San Luis Obispo, Ca 93408

(805) 781-1596

(805) 674-1951 (cell)

fhoneycutt@co.slo.ca.us

Visit Public Works on the Web at: http://www.slocountypwd.org

S Lariz Dear Mr. Honeycutt, My understanding is that th... 12/03/2014 06:04:48 PM
From: S Lariz <s.lariz@yahoo.com>
To: "fhoneycutt@co.slo.ca.us" <fhoneycutt@co.slo.ca.us>
Date: 12/03/2014 06:04 PM
Subject: Re: Test email

Dear Mr. Honeycutt,

My understanding is that the recalculating road fees are $0 due to the fact
that I had an old mobile home there so I would like to with drawl my appeal.
That being said I would also like to request for my appeal fees of $497 to be
refunded to me.

Thank you,

Sofia Lariz

Emerald Wave Media
s.lariz@yahoo.com

(805)928-4334 Cell (805)705-8061

Labuena.FM mega971.com

On Wed, 12/3/14, fhoneycutteco.slo.ca.us <fhoneycutt@co.slo.ca.us> wrote:

Subject: Test email
To: s.lariz@yahoo.com
Date: Wednesday, December 3, 2014, 5:40 PM

Frank Honeycutt, P.E.

Development Services Division Manager

Department of Public Works

County of San Luis Obispo

San Luils Obispo, Ca 93408

(805) 781-1596

(805) 674-1951 (cell)

fhoneycutt@co.slo.ca.us

Visit Public Works on the Web at: http://www.slocountypwd.oxrg
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